
NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

15 

 

 

 

PM12-24/25 Appointment of ten (10) 

contractors for the 

construction of low-cost 

houses (RDP) for a period of 

three (03) years. 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

HSDG 1.M-Eng Tech Civils JV 

Terrytlou Trading Project 

2.Nhlohlori Tilo Trading T/A 

Teleginix 655 

3. Blue Dot G Services 

4. Basia Ke Balobedu 

Holdings Pty Ltd 

5. SDN Civils Pty Ltd 

6. Mberes Trading and 

Projects 

7. Makeyise Trading and 

Projects 

8. Mamondo Development 

and Construction 

9. Ramkol Construction and 

Projects CC 

10. Sabela Mathava JV 

Nyems 

 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

 

16 PM22-24/25 Appointment of two (02) 

service providers to supply 

and deliver of pumps, 

motors, blowers, 

compressors and rewiring of 

motors for a period of three 

(03) years. 

 

 

 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR Bateline Investments  

 

Mmabo Investment Group 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

03 Years 

17 PM21-24/25 Appointment of two (02) 

service providers for the 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates CRR. Nandzu Trade and General 

Projects 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

cleaning and disinfection of 

municipal wide ablution 

facilities for a period of three 

(03) years 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

Mahlatji Mmetji Cleaning and 

Security 

 

18 PM06-24/25 Appointment of service 

provider to reblade the fire 

for a period of three (03) 

years 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR Picabiz 367 CC 03 Years 

19 PM37-24/25 Appointment of a service 

provider for supply, delivery 

and installation of standby 

generators for a period of six 

(06) months 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 3 741 066.84 

CRR Gerson Matamela (Pty) LTD 06 Months 

20 PM27-24/25 Appointment of a service 

provider to supply and deliver 

guard houses for a period of 

three (03) years 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 36 800.00 

CRR Picabiz 367 CC 03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

21 PM16-24/25 Appointment of Ten (10) 

annual contractors to do 

electrical maintenance work 

for a period of three (03) 

years as and when required 

03.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR 1. Excellent Electrical 

Projects 

2. Downlow Construction 

and Projects 

3. Capotex Construction 

4. Magand Projects (Pty) Ltd 

5. Kingki Electrical 

Contractor 

6. Mberes Trading and 

Projects 

7. Seteshe Group 

8.Bateline Investments (Pty) 

Ltd 

9.  Olaotse Solution 

10. Gerson Matamela (Pty) 

Ltd 

 

 

 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

22 PM14-24/25 Appointment of Service 

Providers to be on a panel 

for the provision of 

specialised legal services for 

Polokwane Municipality and 

Entities on an as and when 

required basis for a period of 

three (03) years 

06.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates and Tax 

compliance 

 

CRR 1. Kgadi Phaka Attorney 
Inc 

2. P.M.K Tladi and 
Associates 

3. AM Carrim Attorney 
Inc 

4. Director Makhafola 
Inc 

5. Lebea and Associates 
Attorneys 

6. Tshikhovhi Inc 
Attorneys 

7. Musetsho Law Inc 
8. Kgatla Incorporated 

Attorneys 
9. Mahowa Inc Attorneys 
10. CJ Ntsoane Attorney 

Inc 
11. Maboku Mangena 

Incorporated 
12. Ramusi Attorneys 
13. Mohale Incorporated 
14. Mavuna and 

Netshimbupfe Inc 
15. Clarrence Mangena 

Inc 
16. Adv. Monyela 

Stephen 
17. Dikgati Mphahlele 

Attorneys Inc 
18. MF Maloka Attorney 

and Conveyancers 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

19. Verveen Attorneys 
20. Popela Maake 

Incorporated Attorney 
21. Moloko Phooko 

Attorney 
23 PM15-24/25 Appointment of one (01) 

service provider to supply 

and deliver branded 100L, 50 

micron, green refuse bags in 

a pack of 20 for a period of 

three (03) years 

07.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R77.63 

CRR 10 Zizou Investments 

Property Limited 
03 Years 

24 PM20-24/25 Appointment of two (02) 

service providers for 

fumigation and disinfection of 

municipal wide facilities for a 

period of three (03) years 

07.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR Blue Dot G Services 

Gerson Matamela (Pty) Ltd 

03 Years 

25 PM23-24/25 Appointment of two (02) 

service providers for hiring of 

mobile toilets and septic 

tanks for a period of three 

(03) years 

10.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

CRR TMZ Solutions Pty Ltd 

Chillers On 10 Wheels (Pty) 

Ltd 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

 

26 PM07-24/25                     Supply and Delivery of 

Obsolete Fire Equipment 

(Lighting and High Mast) for 

a Period Three (03) years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 601 869.75 

CRR Matsie Wabo Sukiri (Pty) Ltd 03 Years 

27 PM24-24/25 Appointment of two (02) 

service providers for 

maintenance of fixed 

generators for period of three 

(03) years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR Gerson Matamela (Pty) Ltd 

 

Excellent Electrical Projects 

03 Years 

28 PM25-24/25 Appointment of four (04) 

service providers for the 

supply and delivery of 

building materials for 

maintenance works for 

municipal wide facilities for a 

period of three (03) years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR 1. Devine Project (Pty) 
Ltd 

2. Triple N Business 
Solutions 

3. 10 Zizou Investments 
Proprietary Limited 

4. MberesTrading and 
projects 

03 Years 

29 PM26-24/25 Appointment of three (03) 

service providers for 

electrical building 

maintenance works for 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

 

CRR 1. Excellent Electrical 
Projects 

2. Mpho’s Air-condition 
and Services 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

municipal wide facilities for a 

period of three (03) years 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

3. Clyrotrix (Pty) Ltd 
 

30 PM34-24/25                  Supply and delivery of 

standard square concrete 

bins for a period of three 

years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 1 506.21 

CRR 10 Zizou Investment Pty Ltd 03 Years 

31 PM35-24/25                  Appointment of two (2) 

SANAS accredited service 

providers to service, repair 

and calibrations of laboratory 

equipment at Polokwane 

central lab for a period of 

three (03) years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 44 094.00 

CRR Zamangwane Consultants 

Pty Ltd 
03 Years 

32 PM39-24/25                  Appointment of a Service 

Provider to render anti-

poaching services at game 

reserve for a period of three 

(03) years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 378 707.71 

CRR LJ Mnethi Investments Pty 

Ltd 
03 Years 

33 PM04-24/25                  Supply and delivery of 

portable pumps for the period 

of three (03) years 

24.02.2025 Combined Rates 

R 401 409.28 

CRR Shangwane Trading (Pty)Ltd 03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

34 RT57/2022 Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

Supply and Delivery of One 

(01) Mini Bus 16 Seater 

18.02.2025 R 522 667.46 CRR Toyota South Africa (Pty) Ltd 03 Months 

35 RT57/2022 Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

for the Supply and Delivery 

One (4X2) Double Cab 

Bakkies 

25.02.2025 R 560 545.88 

 

CRR Isuzu Motors South Africa 

Pty Ltd 
03 Months 

36 PM30-24/25 Appointment of two (02) 

service providers for supply 

and delivery of flocculants, 

chlorine products, other 

consumables and 

maintenance of dosing 

equipment for the period of 

three (03) years 

 

18.03.2025 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR Saldana Projects (Pty) Ltd                   

Ndulamiso Aqua Solutions 

03 Years 

37 RT57/2022 Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

for the Supply and Delivery 

31.03.2025 R 3 010 440.96 CRR Komatsu South Africa (Pty) 

Ltd 

03 Month 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

One (01) Komatsu WA320-6 

front end loader 

 


