
NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

3 

 

 

 

PM58/2023 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Appointment of Five (05) 

Service Provider for Supply 

and Delivery of Road Signs, 

Fencing Material and 

Wheelbarrows for a period of 

three (03) years. 

 

10.10.2024 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR T Tlou investments (Pty) Ltd  

 

Kiletji Business Enterprise 

 

Gerson Matamela (Pty)Ltd 

Bright Idea Projects 838 

 

Mmakosha Kekana 

Consulting 

 

 

03 Years 

4 

 

 

 

 

 

 

PM59/2023 

 

 

 

 

 

Appointment of Five (05) 

Service Providers for the 

supply and delivery of Cold 

and Hot Asphalt Mix to 

various Polokwane 

Municipality Clusters for a 

period of three (03) years. 

 

 

16.10.2024  

Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

 

CRR T Tlou Investments Pty Ltd 

 

Maloka Machaba Surfacing 

(Pty) Ltd  

 

Tow Africa 

 

 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

  

 

Forturest Enterprise PTY 

LTD 

 

Picabiz 367 CC 

 

5 PM61/2023 Appointment of Qualified 

Service Provider for the 

Operation and Maintenance 

of Weldevreden Landfill Site 

for a period of three (03) 

years. 

 

 

 

18.10.2024 Combined Rates 

R32 086 956.52 

CRR Maloka Machaba Surfacing 

(Pty) Ltd 

03 Years 

6 PM68/2023 Appointment of Qualified 

Service Provider for the 

Operation and Maintenance 

of Aganang Landfill Site for a 

period of three (03) years. 

 

18.10.2024 Combined Rates 

R32 207 280.00 

CRR Bright Idea Projects 61 03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

7 RT57/2022 

Contract 

 

 

 

 

 

Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

supply and delivery of Five 

(05) GD535-5 Grader 

 

31.10.2024 R14 213 603.19 

 

CRR Komatsu South Africa (Pty) 

Ltd 

03 Months 

8 RT57/2022 

Contract 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

supply and delivery of One 

(01) 20-25 Seater Bus 

 

 

 

 

 

 

31.10.2024 R 1 101 113.00 

 

CRR Isipho Capital Motors 03 Months 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

 

 

 

 

 

9 RT57/2022 

Contract 

Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

supply and delivery of One 

(01) 14-Seater Bus 

31.10.2024 R749 561.95 

 

CRR Toyota South Africa (Pty) Ltd 03 Months 

10 RT57/2022 

Contract 

Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

supply and delivery of One 

(01) Refuse Compactor 

Truck 

31.10.2024 R3 156 500.00 

 

CRR Key Spirit Trading 03 Months 

11 RT57-2022 Appointment as a Service 

Provider from the State 

Transversal Contract for the 

Supply and Delivery of 6000L 

4X2 Fire Fighting Vehicle 

and 4X4 Rapid Intervention 

Vehicle 

12.12.2024 R 9 028 537.82 CRR IVECO Pty Ltd 03 Months 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 

AWARD 

CONTRACT 

AMOUNT 

SOURCE OF 

FUNDING 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 

PERIOD 

12 PM01-24/25 

 

Appointment of Service 

Provider to Supply and 

Deliver Traffic Lights 

(Robots) Equipment and 

Traffic Lights Cables for a 

period of three (03) years. 

18.12.2024 Combined Rates 

R 336 538.30 

CRR Bright Idea Projects 838 3 Years 

13 PM02-24/25 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Appointment of Two (02) 

Service Provider to Supply 

and Deliver 11kv ring main 

units with Circuit Breaker 

Tee-off Switch and Metering 

unit for a period of three (03) 

years. 

 

 

 

 

18.12.2024 Combined Rates 

 

Subjected to 

Negotiations of 

Rates 

 

CRR Devine Projects Pty Ltd 

 

Kingki Electrical Contractor 

3 Years 

14 PM13-24/25 Appointment of Microsoft 

licensing Service Provider to 

implement, support and 

manage Microsoft Products 

and Services  

18.12.2024 Combined Rates 

R 636 525.00 

CRR First Technology Pty Ltd 3 Years 

 


