
 BIDS AWARDED 
 

NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

1 PM42-24/25 Panel of transactional advisors 
to provide advisory services on 
feasibility studies, procurement 
and contract management of 
public private partnership and 
alternative funding projects and 
other related programmes for a 
period of three (03) years. 

16.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Quality based 
Selection 
 

CRR Chiefton Facilities Management (Pty) 
Ltd – Workstream 1 Water and 
Sanitation 
Masala Ramabulana Holdings and MN 
Projects Consultants (Consortium) – 
Workstream 2 Roads and Stormwater 
Masala Ramabulana Holdings and MN 
Projects Consultants (Consortium)- 
Workstream 5: Housing, Land Use and 
Development. 
Chiefton Facilities Management (Pty) 
Ltd - Workstream 5: Housing, Land Use 
and Development. 
Masala Ramabulana Holdings and MN 
Projects Consultants (Consortium – 
Workstream 6 Treasury Management 
Chiefton Facilities Management (Pty) 
Ltd – Workstream 7 Commercialization 
of Strategic Assets 
 

03 Years 

2 PM56-24/25 Appointment of a service 
provider to provide waste 
collection service with with 
compactor trucks, multipurpose 
crane trucks, front-end loader 
and tractor-loader backtoe (TLB) 
for waste collection services at 
city, chuene and Maja clusters 

16.07.2025 R 33 380.00 CRR Makeyise Trading/ Makgaleneo JV 03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

for a period of three (03) years 
on an adhoc basis 

3 PM61-2425 Appointment of a service 
provider to provide waste 
collection service with waste 
compactor trucks, multipurpose 
crane trucks, multipurpose crane 
trucks, front-end loader and 
tractor loader-backhoe (TLB) for 
waste collection services at 
Seshego, Moletji and Aganang 
clusters for a period of three (03) 
years on an adhoc basis. 

17.07.2025 R 22 051.29 CRR Mashumi Construction Supply and 
Projects 

03 Years 

4 PM64-24/25 Appointment of one (01) service 
provider to supply and deliver 
fencing material at Polokwane 
game reserve for a period of 
three (03) years. 

23.07.2025 R 102 419.90 CRR Cheqlist (Pty) Ltd 03 Years 

5 PM33-24/25 Supply and delivery of 240 litre 
polyethylene refuse bins for the 
period of three (03) years. 

17.07.2025  R 2 000.00 CRR Sectional Steel Tanks 03 Years 

6 PM36-24/25 Appointment of Two (02) Service 
Providers to supply laboratory 
reagents and glasswares at 
Polokwane Central Laboratory 
for a period of three (03) years 
 
 
 
 

17.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 
 

CRR Muratho Laboratory Services and 
Consulting 
Ndulamiso Aqua Solutions 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

7 
 

PM59-24/25 
 

Appointment of three (03) 
service providers to supply and 
deliver protective clothing for fire 
brigade, traffic and licensing, 
security and game ranger for a 
period of three (03) years. 
 
 
 

17.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 

CRR Shaledine Group 
 

03 Years 
 

28.07.2025 
 

Combined Rates 
 
Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 

CRR 
 

Mamayila Trading Enterprise 
Cheqlist (Pty) Ltd 
 

8 PM69-24/25 Appointment of Three (03) 
Service Providers to supply and 
deliver furniture and office 
equipment for Polokwane 
Municipal wide facilities for a 
period of three (03) years 
 

17.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 

CRR Triple N Business Solutions (Pty) Ltd 
Shaledine Group 
 

03 Years 
 

28.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 

CRR Dasali investments 8485 
 

9 PM79-24/25 Provision for the Automatic Fare 
Collection System (AFC) for a 
period of three (03) years 

17.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 

PTNG The Naked Scientists 03 Years 

10 PM80-24/25 Provision of the Public 
Transport Management 

17.07.2025 Combined Rates 
 

PTNG The Naked Scientists 03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

System (PTMS) for the 
Polokwane IRPTS for period 
of Three (03) Years 

Subjected to 
Negotiations of 
Rates 
 

11 PM51-24/25 
 

Appointment of six (06) service 
providers for catering services 
for a period of three (03) years 
 

11.08.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 

 

CRR 
 
Mula Projects and General Trading 
Mashery Holdings (Pty) Ltd 
Amogela Kgetsha Trading 
 
 

 

03 Years 
 

14.08.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 
 

CRR Tebello Mogaeleadi Projects 

14.08.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 
 

CRR Rossimoda Events & Function 

14.08.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 
 

CRR Segeru General Suppliers 

12 PM60-2425 
 

Appointment of a service 
provider to provide waste 
collection service with  
compactor trucks, multipurpose 
crane trucks, front-end loader 
and tractor-loader backhoe 
(TLB) for waste collection 

11.08.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 

 

CRR Kgwadi ya Madiba General Trading and 
Projects 

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

services at Mankweng, 
Sebayeng and Dikgale clusters 
for a period of three (03) years. 

13 PM65-24/25 Appointment of two (02) SANAS 
accredited service providers for 
calibration services, 
maintenance, repair and 
replacement of open channel 
flow meters and online analysers 
(for PH and Turbidity) for 
wastewater treatment plants 
within Polokwane municipality 
for a period of three (03) years. 
 

11.08.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 

 

CRR Bogolo Waste Water Management 03 Years 

14 PM78-2425 Appointment of service 
provider to Supply and 
Deliver Cellular Voice and 
Data Services for a period of 
Twenty- Four (24) Months 

14.08.2025   R 9 724.35 CRR Telkom SA SOC Ltd 24 Months 

15 PM67-24/25 Lease of a portion of ERF 366 
Mankweng C measuring 2 
hectares in extent for a period of 
thirty (30) years. 

13.08.2025  R12 750.00 Revenue 
Generatin
g 

Limpopo Hub of Excellence Properties 30 years 

16 RT29-2024 Appointment as a Service 
Provider from the State 
Transversal Contract for Audit 
and Token Identifier (TID) 
Conversion of Existing 
Prepayment Meters and the 
supply ,delivery, installation, 

05.09.2025 Rate Basis CRR African Metering Solution (Pty) Ltd t/a 
AMS Global  

03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

management and maintenance 
of smart metering solution 

17 RT29-2024 Appointment as a Service 
Provider from the State 
Transversal Contract for Audit 
and Token Identifier (TID) 
Conversion of Existing 
Prepayment Meters and the 
supply ,delivery, installation, 
management and maintenance 
of smart metering solution 

05.09.2025 Rate Basis CRR Vodacom Commercial 03 Years 

18 PM63-24/25 Appointment of service providers to 
be on the municipal database of 
independent investigators for the 
period of three (03) years.  

29.09.2025 
 

Quality Based 
Selection 

CRR Leon Zwart Forensics;  
Musetsho Law Inc; 
Bowman Gilfillan Incorporated;  
Sizwe Ntsabo Gobodo Services (Pty) Ltd 

 

03 Years 

19 PM84-24/25 Appointment of a Service 
Provider to conduct Land 
Audit for Polokwane 
Municipality- Wide of all 
properties registered in the 
name of the Municipality 

29.09.2025 Combined Rates 
 
Appointed on rates 
basis. 

 

CRR Chiefton Facilities Management 
(Pty) Ltd 

 

03 Years 

20 PM28-24/25 Appointment of one (01) 
service provider for 
maintenance of sports and 
recreation fields (playing 
surfaces and surrounding 
for a period of three (03) 
years 

29.09.2025 
 

R 360.00 CRR Matsobane Malobela Trading 

 
03 Years 



NO BID NO. BID DESCRIPTION DATE OF 
AWARD 

CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

SOURC
E OF 
FUNDIN
G 

SERVICE PROVIDER  CONTRACT 
PERIOD 

21 PM81-24/25 Request for proposals for the 
Supply and Maintenance of 
Electronic Traffic 
Surveillance Equipment , 
Contravention Management 
System and Accident 
Management System for a 
period of Three (03) Years 

29.09.2025 
 

R630 000.00 CRR Syntell (Pty) Ltd 

 
03 Years 

 


