

1-3



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: FACILITY MANAGEMENT

SBU REP: Calvin Pothapo

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF TWO (2) SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR MAINTENANCE OF FIXED GENERATORS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM24-24/25

SCM REP: Mosone

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: 2EB OR HIGHER

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 27/11/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
1	777 Mps Logistics	R180.55
2	Mophotech Power PTJ	R965.43
3.	MATASE Industrial Solutions	R1734.78
4	ELROI Trading Enterprises	R766.48
5.	Humphrey Engineering Contractors	no bid amount
6.	Matwe Tshabi Consulting Engineers	R556.807
7.	Sheren General Trading	no bid amount
8.	Rems Electrical Construction	R715-3
9.	JaBsi Trading Enterprise	R871.7
10	Cool Breeze Airconditioning Refrigr	R963.47



2-3



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: FACILITY MANAGEMENT

SBU REP: *Calvin Polokwane*

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF TWO (2) SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR MAINTENANCE OF FIXED GENERATORS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM24-24/25

SCM REP: MASOLE

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: 2EB OR HIGHER

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 27/11/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
11	Malakondwe Trading and Projects	R 842.32
12	Tshabalala Multi-Service Workshop	R 469.20
13	Tista Trading (PTY) Ltd	no bid amount
14	July Pencil Trading and Projects	R 473.85
15	Gerson Matamela (PTY) LTD	R 344.92
16	Nazambala Construction	no bid amount
17	Mazeya Business Enterprise	R 572.70
18	Excellent Electrical Projects	R 585.35
19	Mvelase Engineering Services (Pty)	R 1273.81
20	Technomodale CC	R 703.80



3-3



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: FACILITY MANAGEMENT

SBU REP: Calvin Plathapo

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF TWO (2) SERVICE PROVIDERS FOR MAINTENANCE OF FIXED GENERATORS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM24-24/25

SCM REP: MASOLE

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: 2EB OR HIGHER

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 27/11/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
21	RIT Tech Telecoms	R698.05
22	Dinga Consortium	no bid amount
23	TG Precise Engineering	R665.28
24	Mkhwanzi Electrical and House ^{hold}	R472.24
25	ConMash Investment (Pty) Ltd	R1094.80
26	MAHDC Maintenance and Spares	R527.13
27	Auhasei Enterprise	R512.33

27 NOV 2024
 RECEIVED BID
 Ficksburg Municipality

(Handwritten signature)