

1 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

SBU REP: Khomotso

SCM REP: Moss Gore



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
1	Hlawu Maluleke Attorneys Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
2	Ramalekanga Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
3	Noel Chauke Attorneys Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
4	Mitti Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
5	Mmakola Matsimela Incorporated Attorneys	R27 079,05
6	AM Carrim Attorney Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
7	Moyana Barry Inc	R43 560,09
8	Magagula Attorneys	R43 483,80
9	TJ Machebe Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
10	Sebola Nchypetsang Sebola Inc	No amount on invitation to bid

2 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

SBU REP: Khomotso

SCM REP: Moses Kooze



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
11.	Phungo Incorporated	No bid amount on invitation
12.	Aphaco Holdings (pty) Ltd	No bid amount on invitation
13.	Monganye C/N Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
14.	Ndlovu Attorneys	No bid amount on invitation
15.	Ntsoedibe Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
16.	Motomele and Associates	No bid amount on invitation
17.	D.E Semanya Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
18.	Mphahle P.K. Magame Inc	R 19 081.95
19.	M.G. Mafa-Chali Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
20.	Phambane Makone Incorporated	No bid amount on invitation



3 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

SCM REP: Johanna Malebana

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
21	Ntwampe Thobezane Inc	No amount on bid invitation
22	Mlembo and Associates Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
23	Katake Attorneys Inc	No amount on bid invitation
24	Kgadi Phata Attorneys Inc	No amount on bid invitation
25	Director Machefolei Inc	No amount on bid invitation
26	Lebea and Associates Attorney	No amount on bid invitation
27	R2 Attorneys Inc	R22 764 . 66
28	M M Baiyji Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
29	Nchufetsang Inc Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
30	Molatudi Oms Incorporated Attome	No amount on bid invitation



4 - 19

BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomoto

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: MOSES KGOBE

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
31.	Maake Clement Inc Attorneys	No bid Amount on Invitation
32.	M. chune Attorneys Incorporated	No bid Amount on Invitation
33.	Mogadi Olga Maswanganyi	R 16 483.50
34.	MaKwela MP Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on Invitation
35.	Machaba Inc Attorneys	No bid amount on Invitation
36.	Thoriso Makgati Attorneys	R 14 475.00
37.	P.M.K Tladi & Associates	No bid amount on the Invitation
38.	Ligege & Associates Incorporated	R 50 804.13
39.	finger Attorney	No bid amount on invitation
40.	Sergatja Attorneys	No bid amount on Invitation



5 - 19

BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: MOSES GOLE

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
41	DH Gole Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
42	Luvhengo Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
43	Vhonani Nemakanga Incorporated Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
44	Leshilo Attorneys (Kagudi Ripson Leshilo Pty Ltd)	No amount on invitation to bid
45	Khumalo Masondo Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
46	Harman Nethononda Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
47	Makhafola Attorneys Inc	R19 997,35
48	Mahowa Mariballa Incorporated	R76 436,00
49	MP Shai Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
50	Dolamo K Inc	No amount on invitation to bid



0 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomatso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: Moses Kgoe

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
51	TBN Attorneys	R31 148,00
52	Fihla and Associates	No amount on invitation to bid
53	Tshiredo Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
54	Mohiba Inc Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
55	Mokhobi P Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
56	Mathebula H Attorneys	R25 928,00
57	Tshikovi Inc Attorneys	R34 701,82
58	Makwela and Mabeleja Inc Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
59	NRM Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
60	MT Makhubela Incorporated Attorneys	R90 384,25



7 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

SCM REP: MOSES KGOCE

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
61	Kirchmanns Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
62	Mvundlela & Associates Attorneys Inc	R14 082,90
63	Jonathan Jacobs and Associates	No amount on invitation to bid
64	Leepile Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
65	Madiba & Co Attorneys	R11 399,95
66	John Mulaudzi Inc	R24 284
67	Nedohle K Attorneys	R24 743,98
68	Shuping Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
69	Kgorane Shabalala Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
70	Mbokota Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid



8-19

BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: Johanna Malebana

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
71	Musersho Law Inc	R41 833.00 No amount on bid invitation
72	Lamula K.B Attorneys	
73	Moretia Mmamabolo Inc	R46 188.60 No amount on bid invitation
74	Ntsoane Attorneys	
75	Iseian Nyekhi Attorneys Incorporated	R70 367.92 No amount on bid invitation
76	A Mbonga Attorneys Inc	No amount on bid invitation
77	Tookey Nyezi Rambau Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
78	Mathumbila Inc Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
79	Lebea Incorporated Attorney	No amount on bid invitation
80	Maribana Matogoa Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation



9 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

SCM REP: MOSES KGOLLE

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
81	DENGA INCORPORATED	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
82	G. CHABALALA INCORPORATED	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
83	DABISHI NTHAMBELENI ATTORNEYS	R31559.45
84	RANATE NSEBENGANI ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
85	RADZILANI KERANI MASHULA	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID AMOUNT
86	MOCEFE NACHAKA ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
87	MOLOKO PHOOLKO ATTORNEYS	R16 016.00
88	TS MACHUBELA ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON INVITATION TO BID
89	M.S MOLOTO ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
90	MABJANA THULARE ATTORNEYS	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION



10-19

BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

SCM REP: Moses Kholo

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

SBU REP: Khomato



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
91	XGATLA INCORPORATES ATTORNEYS	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
92	CAVIN MAMISI ATTORNEYS	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
93	MAFEA AND ASSOCIATES INCORPORATED	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
94	MAHOWA INC ATTORNEYS	R22 776.90
95	NKAMMENG ATTORNEYS INC	R 850 000.00
96	NIMOREPO INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
97	CJ NISOANE ATTORNEYS INC	R36 589.55
98	SW ZIKALALA ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
99	MOLEFE DEPU INCORPORATED	R22 882.50
100	MABOKU MANGENYA ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION



11 - 19

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

SCM REP: Johanna Maebana

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

BID REGISTRATION FORM

SBU REP: Khomotso



NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
101	Prince Mudau and Associates Inc	R 50 616 . 05
102	Ramusisi Attorneys Inc	No amount on bid invitation
103	Ngoepe Law Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
104	MN Maseha Attorneys Inc	No amount on bid invitation
105	Everton Dancu Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
106	Serokela Mashowa Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
107	Nobela Attorneys Inc	R 23 828 . 58
108	Chuene Malio Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
109	Is Makumbela Attorneys Inc	No amount on bid invitation
110	Salijee Govender vander Merwe Att	No amount on bid invitation



12-19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: MOSES KGOBE

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
111	Mohabe Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
112	Kabelo Mafq Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
113	M.T Ramabala Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
114	Steven Maluleke Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid
115	Mavuna and Netshimbye Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
116	Mathopo Makweya Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
117	Kgohlisi Abie Mamabolo Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
118	L.P Mkhabele Attorneys Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
119	Modise Mabule Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
120	Mpoyana Ledwaba Inc Attorneys	No amount on invitation to bid



13 - 19



STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomatso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: Moses Kgole

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

BID REGISTRATION FORM

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
121	Clarence Mangena Inc	No bid amount on invitation
122	TM chaute Incorporated	R 26 686.00
123	Raphesu JL Attorneys	No bid amount on invitation
124	TF Matlakala Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
125	Zar Attorneys Inc.	No bid amount on invitation
126	Motsoai Attorneys Inc	R 30 749.00
127	V Simango Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
128	Korani Attorneys	No bid amount on invitation
129	A.O.V. Monyela Stephen	No bid amount on invitation
130	Thuto M. Holdings & Mansa Gbwal	No bid Amount on invitation



14-19



STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

BID REGISTRATION FORM

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: Moss 10406

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
131	S.S Maluleka Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
132	Letsele Nkondo Associates Incorporated	No amount on invitation to bid
133	Dikgati Mphahlele Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
134	Ndobela and Associates Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
135	Rachoele Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
136	Credit Intelligence (Pty) Ltd	No amount on invitation to bid
137	T.T Ngobeni Attorneys Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
138	M.F Maloka Attorneys & Conveyancers	R45 165,00
139	Ngoako Seabela Inc	No amount on invitation to bid
140	NN Mahumani Inc	No amount on invitation to bid



15-19

Polokwane Municipality

18 SEP 2024



RECEIVED BID

BID REGISTRATION FORM

SBU REP: Khomatso

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

SCM REP: Noses Gooce

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
141	RASEASALA D.S ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
142	FR CHAUKE INCORPORATED	R44 102.50
143	VERVEEN ATTORNEYS	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
144	MADIMA ATTORNEYS INC	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
145	BORNAN DUMA ZITHA ATTORNEYS	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
146	MACHAKA INC INCORPORATED	NO BID AMOUNT ON BID INVITATION
147	MPHOS MOHABE INC	R26 811.00
148	BEAUEL MONAKISI ATTORNEYS INC	R15 644.50
149	JU SM SIBIYA INC P K B THUPAA TSEBE	R69 415.00
150	RANTHO INC	R11 714.53



16-19



SBU REP: Khomotso

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: Mostes Kgoale

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
151	Taka Machabaphala Inc	No bid amount on invitation
152	Seanego Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
153	lebone Risk solutions (Pty) Ltd	No bid amount on invitation
154	NK Vukoya Attorneys Inc	No bid amount on invitation
155	ML Meteme Inc	R 62 792.88
156	Nkoana Attorneys	No bid amount on invitation
157	Popela Maake Incorporated Attorneys	No bid amount on invitation
158	Mashabela Attorneys Incorporated	R 60 318.08
159	ME Kuaho Inc t/a Kuaho Attorneys	R 49 764.53
160	Lekhu Pilson Attorneys Incorp	No bid amount on invitation



17 - 19



BID REGISTRATION FORM

STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: Khomotso

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

SCM REP: Johanna Malebana

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
161	Maxivate Attorneys Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
162	SB Wotshela Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
163	Mametele Attorneys Inc	R2 675 P1h
164	Shelene Jacob Nyofu TIA Nyoffu	No amount on bid invitation
165	Am Vilakazi Teu Inc Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
166	Seleta Attorneys Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation
167	Mncodisi Ndiouu E Sedumedi Attorneys	No amount on bid invitation
168	S.m vakausa inc	R21 158 .90
169	Maduba Matsai Masitemyame &	No amount on bid invitation
170	MB Masuoa Incorporated	No amount on bid invitation



18 - 19



STRATEGIC BUSINESS UNIT: LEGAL SERVICES

SBU REP: *Khametso*

DESCRIPTION: APPOINTMENT OF SERVICE PROVIDERS TO BE ON THE PANEL FOR THE PROVISION OF SPECIALIZED LEGAL SERVICES FOR POLOKWANE MUNICIPALITY AND ENTITIES ON AN AS-AND-WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF THREE (03) YEARS

BID NUMBER: PM14-24/25

SCM REP: *Moses Kgole*

PROJECT'S CIDB CLASSIFICATION: N/A

CLOSING DATE AND TIME: 18/09/2024 @10H00

BID REGISTRATION FORM

NO	NAME OF BIDDER	BID AMOUNT
171	<i>Mogaswa and Associates Inc</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>
172	<i>G Mabunda Inc</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>
173	<i>KLM Maja Attorneys</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>
174	<i>Noko Mainela Inc</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>
175	<i>Raphela Attorneys Inc</i>	<i>R 30 957,62</i>
176	<i>Maluleke Inc T/A Maluks Attorneys</i>	<i>R 18 370,01</i>
177	<i>Nkosi Sabelo Incorporated</i>	<i>R 50 456,64</i>
178	<i>Nandi Bulabula Incorporated</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>
179	<i>Poswa Incorporated</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>
180	<i>Meshele Attorneys Inc</i>	<i>No amount on invitation to bid</i>

